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The hero of this mordant portrayal of life in contemporary Cuba is a black Cuban whose parents were
enthusiastic supporters of the Castro Revolution. His father, however, having fallen foul of the regime, is
accused of embezzlement and dies of a stroke. Following her husband's death, his mother flees the country
and settles in Madrid. Our hero separates from his wife and now spends much of his time in the company of
his Russian neighbor, from whom he discovers the pleasures of reading. The books he reads gradually open
his eyes to the incongruity between party slogans and the gray oppressive reality that surrounds him: the
office routine; the daily complaints of his colleagues about problems big and small; his own obsessive
thoughts which circulate like a broken record. Every day he photographs the spontaneous eruptions of
dissent on the streets and witnesses the sad spectacle of young people crowding onto makeshift rafts and
leaving the island. Every night he suffers from Kafkaesque nightmares in which he is arrested and tried for
unknown crimes. His disappointment and delusion grow until a day comes when he declares his
unwillingness to become an informer, and his real troubles begin.

33 Revolutions is a candid and moving story about the disappointments of a generation that believed in the
ideals of the Castro Recolution. it is a unique look into the lives of ordinary people in Cuba over the past five
decades and a stylish work of fiction about a young man's awakening.
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From reader reviews:

Thomas Moore:

Book is definitely written, printed, or created for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
guide. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important matter to bring us around the world.
Beside that you can your reading talent was fluently. A publication 33 Revolutions will make you to end up
being smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know about anything. But some of you think that
open or reading a book make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you
looking for best book or suitable book with you?

Michael Brown:

The book 33 Revolutions can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about
everything you want. Why then must we leave the best thing like a book 33 Revolutions? Several of you
have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim that book can give many info for us. It is absolutely
correct. Right now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or information that you take for that, you may
give for each other; you may share all of these. Book 33 Revolutions has simple shape but you know: it has
great and large function for you. You can look the enormous world by available and read a reserve. So it is
very wonderful.

Jacqueline Carter:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. As
it is known to us that book is very important for us. The book 33 Revolutions was making you to know about
other knowledge and of course you can take more information. It is quite advantages for you. The book 33
Revolutions is not only giving you more new information but also to be your friend when you sense bored.
You can spend your own spend time to read your guide. Try to make relationship with the book 33
Revolutions. You never sense lose out for everything in the event you read some books.

Jennifer Randolph:

The book with title 33 Revolutions has a lot of information that you can find out it. You can get a lot of
profit after read this book. That book exist new information the information that exist in this book
represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the
world. This kind of book will bring you with new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book with
your smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.
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