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There are many concisely written and repeated teachings in the bible that most clergy and church members
cannot reconcile: Did you know that Jesus repeatedly taught that “many” who call Him Lord will be shocked
to learn that He will not allow them into His kingdom? Did you know Jesus told people who were trying to
come to terms with who He claimed to be, to stop, as He explained that “no one is able to come to Him
unless the Father enables them”? How can Jesus’ statements be true and yet be in harmony with Peter’s
teaching that God desires that not one person should perish? Did you know that Jesus forgave many who
never asked, while others who asked Him in faith did not necessarily receive His promise? Jesus strictly
forbade His disciples from teaching others that He was the Christ and then instructed them to go and preach?
What then did they preach? Did you know that John the Baptist, the apostles and Paul could not figure out
who Jesus was? What is their testimony regarding where their faith came from? Did you know that Jesus
said that those with the revelation of God’s will would be more accountable than those who did not know?
Did you know that Jesus said “whoever believes in me will do the work I have been doing.” When asked
why He did not intend to show Himself to the whole world He replied, “those who love me will be doing as I
am doing.” So what is Jesus’ explanation of ‘belief, trust and faith’? Given so many unsettling questions, can
we be 100% certain of forgiveness for accepting Jesus as Savior while glossing over many of the other
consistent teachings? Let us consider that Jesus, Paul, Peter and John understood perfectly what they were
communicating, and so can we, without twisting, omitting or placing greater emphasis on some scriptures
over others. Discover that God has a greater purpose in creating each of us than to sing songs, acknowledge
our failures and ask for forgiveness.
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From reader reviews:

Charles Anthony:

Throughout other case, little men and women like to read book Who Will Go To Heaven: What The Bible
Teaches. You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. So long as we know about how is
important any book Who Will Go To Heaven: What The Bible Teaches. You can add know-how and of
course you can around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, because from book you can understand
everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple factor until
wonderful thing it is possible to know that. In this era, we can open a book or searching by internet product.
It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's examine.

Jerry Lyon:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind talent or
thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book compared to can satisfy
your short time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find publication that need more time
to be read. Who Will Go To Heaven: What The Bible Teaches can be your answer because it can be read by
you actually who have those short extra time problems.

Faye Michaels:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
much easier to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspaper, book,
and soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. Typically the book
that recommended to you personally is Who Will Go To Heaven: What The Bible Teaches this book consist
a lot of the information from the condition of this world now. That book was represented how do the world
has grown up. The language styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer
made some research when he makes this book. That's why this book suited all of you.

Jodi Dunn:

Is it you who having spare time and then spend it whole day by watching television programs or just lying
down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Who Will Go To Heaven: What The Bible Teaches can
be the solution, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your extra time by
reading in this fresh era is common not a nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?
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