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A spellbinding tale of the sea: love, murder, and mysticism.

At the turn of the century, a Kwakiutl warrior from British Columbia's wild northern islands raids an artifact
collector's yacht to reclaim stolen sacred masks. He takes the collector's wife, Kate, as hostage on his 200-
mile canoe voyage home. The collector hires Dugger, a coastal trader living on the edges of the law, to give
chase in his ketch with the collector as passenger, but Dugger's financial salvation comes at a terrible price,
for he is Kate's secret lover. Day and night Dugger sails the uncharted islands, through raging currents and
ship-swallowing whirlpools, and the account of his pursuit is interwoven with Kate's harrowing and
erotically charged journey.

Based on a true story, this novel reaches its thrilling climax at the last secret, hallucinatory potlatch of the
ancient Kwakiutl culture, where the history of a doomed people is melded with the fury of three hearts.
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From reader reviews:

Virginia Combs:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a
wander, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book eligible Ghost Sea: A Novel
(Dugger/Nello Series)? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time
along with your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you
have various other opinion?

Clyde Connell:

As people who live in often the modest era should be up-date about what going on or details even knowledge
to make all of them keep up with the era and that is always change and move forward. Some of you maybe
will probably update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for you but the problems
coming to anyone is you don't know what type you should start with. This Ghost Sea: A Novel
(Dugger/Nello Series) is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, since this book
serves what you want and want in this era.

Roger Hodge:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
so. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a book will give you a lot of new details.
When you read a reserve you will get new information because book is one of various ways to share the
information or maybe their idea. Second, examining a book will make an individual more imaginative. When
you studying a book especially hype book the author will bring that you imagine the story how the people do
it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other folks. When you read this Ghost Sea: A Novel
(Dugger/Nello Series), it is possible to tells your family, friends and also soon about yours book. Your
knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a guide.

Heather Bly:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family,
or their very own friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, gonna beach, or picnic
from the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to fill your
own free time/ holiday? May be reading a book might be option to fill your free time/ holiday. The first thing
you ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want to attempt look for book, may be
the guide untitled Ghost Sea: A Novel (Dugger/Nello Series) can be very good book to read. May be it may
be best activity to you.
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