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Set several years in the future, sixteen-year-old Ricky Romanello, a college freshman, is playing basketball
when he collapses and winds up in a coma suffering from a powerful flu that hits the U.S. population causing
deaths and a dramatic economic slowdown. Research scientist Dr. Mandy Fox has been developing an anti-
aging drug that she believes might also eradicate the flu. Ricky becomes one of the test subjects. The
government rushes approval for the drug but Ricky and others soon discover there is an unintended side
effect of the new drug and vaccine with severe consequences for him and for the entire population. Praise for
ATOM & EVE: “Atom and Eve” is one of the most imaginative young adult novels I have read in quite a
while and a great debut for its author, Jeff Yager. Its mix of suspense, science, romance, and even politics
will keep the reader turning the pages to find out what happens next, and there are enough twists and turns to
ensure the pace never slackens. I can't wait to see the movie!"?Alan Caruba, Editor, Bookviews.com,
Founding member of the National Book Critics Circle About the Author: Jeff Yager grew up in Stamford,
Connecticut and now lives in Clearwater, Florida. Atom and Eve is his first novel.
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From reader reviews:

Donna Beckman:

Throughout other case, little people like to read book Atom and Eve. You can choose the best book if you'd
prefer reading a book. Providing we know about how is important any book Atom and Eve. You can add
information and of course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from
book you can understand everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you will find yourself known.
About simple factor until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, you can open a book or perhaps
searching by internet device. It is called e-book. You should use it when you feel uninterested to go to the
library. Let's go through.

Bob Pratt:

What do you about book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you want something to
explain what the ones you have problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy man? If you don't
have spare time to try and do others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have time? What did
you do? Every person has many questions above. They need to answer that question mainly because just
their can do that will. It said that about guide. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is proper. Because
start from on jardín de infancia until university need this Atom and Eve to read.

Arthur Elsberry:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive now, people have do
something to make these survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and notice by
surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated it for a while is reading. That's why,
by reading a e-book your ability to survive enhance then having chance to stay than other is high. To suit
your needs who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this Atom and Eve book as beginner
and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Daniel Starnes:

The publication with title Atom and Eve contains a lot of information that you can find out it. You can get a
lot of advantage after read this book. That book exist new information the information that exist in this
reserve represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to yo7u to find out how the
improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you with new era of the globalization. You can read
the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.
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