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A founding member of Guns N’ Roses and Velvet Revolver shares the story of his rise to the pinnacle of
fame and fortune, his struggles with alcoholism and drug addiction, his personal crash and burn, and his
phoenix-like transformation via a unique path to sobriety.

In 1984, at the age of twenty, Duff McKagan left his native Seattle—partly to pursue music but mainly to get
away from a host of heroin overdoses then decimating his closest group of friends in the local punk scene. In
L.A. only a few weeks and still living in his car, he answered a want ad for a bass player placed by someone
who identified himself only as “Slash.” Soon after, the most dangerous band in the world was born. Guns N’
Roses went on to sell more than 100 million albums worldwide.

In It's So Easy, Duff recounts GN’R’s unlikely trajectory to a string of multiplatinum albums, sold-out
stadium concerts, and global acclaim. But that kind of glory can take its toll, and it did—ultimately—on
Duff, as well as on the band itself. As GN’R began to splinter, Duff felt that he himself was done, too. But
his near death as a direct result of alcoholism proved to be his watershed, the turning point that led to his
unique path to sobriety and the unexpected choices he has made for himself since. In a voice that is as honest
as it is indelibly his own, Duff—one of rock’s smartest and most articulate personalities—takes readers on
his harrowing journey through the dark heart of one of the most notorious bands in rock-and-roll history and
out the other side.

 Download It's So Easy: and other lies ...pdf

 Read Online It's So Easy: and other lies ...pdf

http://ijos.club/go/read.php?id=145160663X
http://ijos.club/go/read.php?id=145160663X
http://ijos.club/go/read.php?id=145160663X
http://ijos.club/go/read.php?id=145160663X
http://ijos.club/go/read.php?id=145160663X
http://ijos.club/go/read.php?id=145160663X
http://ijos.club/go/read.php?id=145160663X
http://ijos.club/go/read.php?id=145160663X


Download and Read Free Online It's So Easy: and other lies Duff McKagan

From reader reviews:

Juanita Jones:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to take
a stroll, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or even read a book entitled It's So Easy:
and other lies? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time using your
favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you have other opinion?

Lanell Sessions:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the concept It's So
Easy: and other lies suitable to you? The book was written by renowned writer in this era. Typically the book
untitled It's So Easy: and other liesis the one of several books that everyone read now. This book was
inspired a number of people in the world. When you read this guide you will enter the new shape that you
ever know ahead of. The author explained their concept in the simple way, and so all of people can easily to
be aware of the core of this reserve. This book will give you a great deal of information about this world
now. To help you to see the represented of the world within this book.

Richard Cary:

Beside this particular It's So Easy: and other lies in your phone, it can give you a way to get more close to the
new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you are going to got here is fresh from your
oven so don't always be worry if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow small town. It is good thing
to have It's So Easy: and other lies because this book offers to your account readable information. Do you
oftentimes have book but you rarely get what it's all about. Oh come on, that would not happen if you have
this inside your hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island.
Use you still want to miss this? Find this book along with read it from at this point!

Elizabeth Nicholson:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got scholars? We believe that that problem
was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And you know
that little person just like reading or as examining become their hobby. You have to know that reading is
very important in addition to book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except
your own teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update regarding something by book. Amount
types of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is niagra It's So Easy: and other lies.
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